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This clearly written treatise is designed to make very accessible the complex subject of corporate taxation by
using non-technical, straightforward language, charts, checklists, diagrams, and numerous examples to aid
readers understanding. The book starts with an introductory chapter that discusses the choice of business
form; the general principle that corporate profits are subject to double taxation (once at the corporate level
and again at the shareholder level); and the basics of anti-abuse rules, such as the step-transaction doctrine.
Those anti-abuse rules are explored in more detail in a later chapter, as are proposals to partially or fully
eliminate double taxation. The next several chapters are organized using a cradle-to-grave approach that
traces the life cycle of a corporation, beginning with formation and capitalization and ending with corporate
''death,'' liquidation. Between those events, the book discusses operational issues, including the capital
structure of a corporation, distributions of cash or property, stock redemptions, and stock dividends. After
corporate liquidations, the book explores more advanced topics, such as taxable stock or asset acquisitions;
non-taxable corporate reorganizations and divisions; the carryover of tax attributes (such as net operating
losses) following certain non-recognition transactions; and the treatment of corporate tax shelters. In
addition, a chapter addresses the taxation of S corporations, which generally provides a single-tax paradigm.
Understanding Corporate Taxation also includes discussion of relevant cases. It is designed to supplement
any corporate tax casebook or to be used on its own
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From reader reviews:

Bradley Smith:

The guide untitled Understanding Corporate Taxation, Third Edition is the guide that recommended to you to
study. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to an individual. The language that
creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of exploration when
write the book, therefore the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the
e-book of Understanding Corporate Taxation, Third Edition from the publisher to make you considerably
more enjoy free time.

Andrew Howe:

The book untitled Understanding Corporate Taxation, Third Edition contain a lot of information on the item.
The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so
do not really worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was published by famous author. The author
will bring you in the new era of literary works. You can read this book because you can continue reading
your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can open their official web-site and order it. Have a nice learn.

Sandra Davis:

On this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you need to do is
just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of the books in the top
list in your reading list is usually Understanding Corporate Taxation, Third Edition. This book that is
certainly qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking
upward and review this book you can get many advantages.

Larry Mason:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Understanding Corporate Taxation, Third Edition
was bright colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Understanding
Corporate Taxation, Third Edition has many kinds or category. Start from kids until teens. For example
Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of
book usually are make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for
yourself and try to like reading that will.
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