
Entrepreneurial Finance and Accounting for High-
Tech Companies (MIT Press)

Frank J. Fabozzi

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0262034980
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0262034980
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0262034980


Entrepreneurial Finance and Accounting for High-Tech
Companies (MIT Press)

Frank J. Fabozzi

Entrepreneurial Finance and Accounting for High-Tech Companies (MIT Press) Frank J. Fabozzi

This book offers an accessible guide to the financial aspects of launching and operating a high-tech business
in such areas as engineering, computing, and science. It explains a range of subjects -- from risk analysis to
stock incentive programs for founders and key employees -- for students and aspiring entrepreneurs who
have no prior training in finance or accounting.

The book begins with the rigorous analysis any prospective entrepreneur should undertake before launching
a business, covering risks associated with a new venture, the reasons startup companies fail, and the stages of
financing. It goes on to discuss business models and their components, business plans, and exit planning;
forms of business organization, and factors to consider in choosing one; equity allocation to founders and
employees; applicable U.S. securities law; and sources of equity capital. The book describes principles of
financial accounting, the four basic financial statements, and financial ratios useful in assessing management
performance. It also explains financial planning and the use of budgets; profit planning; stock options and
other option-type awards; methodologies for valuing a private company; economic assessment of a potential
investment project; and the real options approach to risk and managerial flexibility. Appendixes offer case
studies of Uber and of the valuation of Tentex.
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From reader reviews:

Carolyn Baird:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can add
your knowledge by the publication entitled Entrepreneurial Finance and Accounting for High-Tech
Companies (MIT Press). Try to the actual book Entrepreneurial Finance and Accounting for High-Tech
Companies (MIT Press) as your friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you feel alone and beside
those of course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book
makes you more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let us make new experience
and knowledge with this book.

Charles Branch:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called Entrepreneurial
Finance and Accounting for High-Tech Companies (MIT Press)? Maybe it is for being best activity for you.
You recognize beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can smarter than
before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have some other opinion?

Shalon Dougherty:

Do you considered one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold
on guys this specific aren't like that. This Entrepreneurial Finance and Accounting for High-Tech Companies
(MIT Press) book is readable simply by you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the details here
are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to
provide to you. The writer connected with Entrepreneurial Finance and Accounting for High-Tech
Companies (MIT Press) content conveys thinking easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-
book are not different in the written content but it just different available as it. So , do you still thinking
Entrepreneurial Finance and Accounting for High-Tech Companies (MIT Press) is not loveable to be your
top listing reading book?

Ernest Poole:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart and
soul or real their pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right
now there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring along
with can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for
yourself. As we know that on this era, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to



reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Entrepreneurial Finance and Accounting for High-Tech Companies
(MIT Press) can make you really feel more interested to read.
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