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Abigail d'Alene has been sinfully in love with learning all her life, and she now has the means and freedom
to indulge in her passion. Disguised as a boy, she heads to the Latin Quarter of Paris and the abbey schools
that will one day change the world. Shocked by the ineptitude of her masquerade, Alain of Huntly Woods
takes Abigail under his protection until she recovers her sense and goes home. But her audacity and
intelligence spark enough friction between them to burn through his cold logic and carefully laid plans. In
1159 Paris as a spy for Henry II, Alain has sold his soul to the Angevin devil in exchange for the king's
promise of an heiress, land and power. As his good intentions bring him unexpected passion, he struggles to
find a way to have it all. Then he discovers Abigail's uncle, confessor to King Louis VII of France, plots
against the English king, and Alain must choose between protecting his king or the woman he loves.
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From reader reviews:

Judith Jordan:

Here thing why this specific Art of Love are different and reliable to be yours. First of all reading through a
book is good but it really depends in the content than it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Art
of Love giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any publication out there but there
is no publication that similar with Art of Love. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your current
eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. You can
actually bring everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your way home by train. For anyone who is
having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of Art of Love in e-book can be your
alternative.

Sadie McBride:

Art of Love can be one of your nice books that are good idea. We all recommend that straight away because
this publication has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit
entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The article author giving his/her effort to get every
word into joy arrangement in writing Art of Love although doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader
the hottest along with based confirm resource info that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great
information can drawn you into completely new stage of crucial imagining.

Lawrence Elam:

This Art of Love is great book for you because the content and that is full of information for you who always
deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it data accurately
using great manage word or we can claim no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read this hurriedly you
can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but tough core
information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having Art of Love in your hand like keeping the world in
your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no reserve that offer you world within ten or
fifteen tiny right but this book already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs.
stressful do you still doubt in which?

Priscilla Garcia:

Beside this particular Art of Love in your phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge
or info. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh from your oven so don't always be
worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Art of Love because this
book offers for you readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you seldom get what it's all
about. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be
questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss that? Find this book and read it
from currently!
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