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A shark swims through a kitchen. A biology teacher peels the flesh from a dead angel. A billion bees swarm
the Empire State Building. In an empty attic, a teapot filled with lizards reaches a boil. Everything is
understood when a small town sheriff bites into an eyeball. These are the gates into the world of James
Maxey. Good luck on finding your way back out. James Maxey's award winning short fiction has appeared
in Asimov's, Orson Scott Card's Intergalactic Medicine Show, and over a dozen other magazines and
anthologies. There is No Wheel collects his ten most critically acclaimed tales. To the East, a Bright Star: A
former circus aerialist rescues a trapped girl as the ultimate natural disaster draws nearer. Silent as Dust: A
tale of Seven Chimneys, a haunted house with one ghost too many. Final Flight of the Blue Bee: The Blue
Bee’s former sidekick, Stinger, is released from prison after forty years. Can a venom gun, an army of bees,
and a hostage deliver him the justice he deserves? Empire of Dreams and Miracles: In Atlantis, no one need
ever fear poverty, disease, or death. But what is left of humanity once all the great struggles are won? Return
to Sender: Crystal Lance is a half-breed angel assigned to root out a demonic cult in a small college town.
The monks who’ve raised her have trained her in martial arts and taught her the true names of the 7,777
heavenly powers. But before Crystal can complete her holy mission, she must survive the temptations of
coffee, pizza, her first kiss, and Elvis. Pentacle on His Forehead, Lizard on His Breath: A junkie uses drugs
and magic to search for his dead father, leading his girlfriend to hide all the knives. To Know All Things
That Are In the Earth: In the aftermath of the Rapture, a scientist attempts to understand the mind of God
through the autopsy of an angel. Echo of the Eye: In a town of famous for its barbeque, the butcher is a
vegetarian. Mostly. Where Their Worm Dieth Not: Atomahawk! She-Devil! Retaliator! The most powerful
members of the Law Legion must unite to thwart the villainous scheme of the Prime Mover, until Retaliator
discovers that they may be in the grip of an even more insidious evil. Perhaps the Snail: A young woman is
invited back to the trailer of her pop-star idol for a sex act involving a silver tray, a wine bottle, a pistol, a
tropical snail, and sudden mystic glimpse of the entirety of creation. Edmund Schubert, editor of Orson Scott
Card’s Intergalactic Medicine Show, where three of these stories were first published, writes in the
introduction: “One thing about James: he pushes boundaries, and he pushes them hard. … James’s stories
require a strong mind and strong stomach. They’re freaky weird and hauntingly honest at the same time.”
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From reader reviews:

Nathaniel Gonzalez:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
require something to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man or
woman? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have
time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They should answer that question due to
the fact just their can do that will. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
appropriate. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of There Is No Wheel to read.

Jean Ashburn:

Here thing why this kind of There Is No Wheel are different and reliable to be yours. First of all reading a
book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of it which is the content is as delicious as food or not.
There Is No Wheel giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any publication out there
but there is no book that similar with There Is No Wheel. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your
current eyes about the thing which happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. You
can bring everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your technique home by train. When you are
having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of There Is No Wheel in e-book can be your
alternate.

Leslie Bergeron:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its include may doesn't work
at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside look
likes. Maybe you answer can be There Is No Wheel why because the amazing cover that make you consider
with regards to the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the
outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

John Yates:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or make
summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart and soul or real
their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there
but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that
on this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. So , this There Is No Wheel can make you sense more interested to read.
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