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This advanced treatment of elasticity from the atomistic viewpoint offers students and teachers a self-
contained text. Its detailed development of the general principles of statistical mechanics leads to a
concentration on the principles' application to the elastic behavior of solids. The first part is based solely on
classical mechanics, starting with an introductory chapter that summarizes thermoelasticity from the
continuum viewpoint. The principles of classical statistical mechanics are then developed and applied to the
study of the thermoelastic behavior of both crystalline and polymeric solids. The second part is based on
quantum mechanics, discussing their role in interatomic force laws, the manner in which quantum statistical
effects modify the low-temperature mechanical behavior of solids, and the nature of quantum effects upon
the rates of thermally activated processes. This book provides an alternative to the usual course in statistical
mechanics in which the major emphasis is on applications to gases, liquids, and electronic and magnetic
phenomena. Graduate students of physics and chemistry will appreciate the treatment of the basic principles
of classical statistical mechanics and quantum statistical mechanics, while polymer physicists will find the
discussion of curvilinear coordinates, geometric constraints, and the distinction between rigid and flexible
polymer models of particular interest. 96 figures. 1983 edition.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Henricks:

Book will be written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A guide Statistical Mechanics of Elasticity
will make you to always be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about everything.
But some of you think that open or reading any book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun.
Why they might be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suitable book with you?

Breanne Gardner:

This Statistical Mechanics of Elasticity book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in
your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book will be information inside this reserve incredible
fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. That
Statistical Mechanics of Elasticity without we recognize teach the one who looking at it become critical in
imagining and analyzing. Don't become worry Statistical Mechanics of Elasticity can bring once you are and
not make your handbag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it with your lovely
laptop even telephone. This Statistical Mechanics of Elasticity having excellent arrangement in word in
addition to layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Robert Delaney:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, quick story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving Statistical Mechanics of
Elasticity that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading practice
all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world a great deal better then how they react
towards the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky particular person
but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all you who want to start looking at as
your good habit, you are able to pick Statistical Mechanics of Elasticity become your starter.

Mikel Davis:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This book Statistical Mechanics of Elasticity was colorful and
of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Statistical Mechanics of Elasticity has many
kinds or category. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can
read and think that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it
can make you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like
reading that will.
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