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Is love “blind” when it comes to gender? For women, it just might be. This unsettling and original book
offers a radical new understanding of the context-dependent nature of female sexuality. Lisa M. Diamond
argues that for some women, love and desire are not rigidly heterosexual or homosexual but fluid, changing
as women move through the stages of life, various social groups, and, most important, different love
relationships. This perspective clashes with traditional views of sexual orientation as a stable and fixed trait.
But that view is based on research conducted almost entirely on men. Diamond is the first to study a large
group of women over time. She has tracked one hundred women for more than ten years as they have
emerged from adolescence into adulthood. She summarizes their experiences and reviews research ranging
from the psychology of love to the biology of sex differences. Sexual Fluidity offers moving first-person
accounts of women falling in and out of love with men or women at different times in their lives. For some,
gender becomes irrelevant: “I fall in love with the person, not the gender,” say some respondents. Sexual
Fluidity offers a new understanding of women’s sexuality?and of the central importance of love.
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From reader reviews:

Michelle Pacheco:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yep,
you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or read a book eligible Sexual Fluidity: Understanding
Women's Love and Desire? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend
your time along with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you
have some other opinion?

Christina Mundell:

This Sexual Fluidity: Understanding Women's Love and Desire book is just not ordinary book, you have
after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is definitely information
inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper a person read a lot of
information you will get. This particular Sexual Fluidity: Understanding Women's Love and Desire without
we comprehend teach the one who looking at it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't always be
worry Sexual Fluidity: Understanding Women's Love and Desire can bring if you are and not make your
case space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even phone. This
Sexual Fluidity: Understanding Women's Love and Desire having fine arrangement in word and also layout,
so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Robert Wilkerson:

Exactly why? Because this Sexual Fluidity: Understanding Women's Love and Desire is an unordinary book
that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will distress you with the secret it
inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such awesome way
makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So
, it is good for you because of not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it. This unique
book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book have got such as help improving your skill
and your critical thinking way. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I had been you I will go to the
e-book store hurriedly.

Audra Yoder:

Sexual Fluidity: Understanding Women's Love and Desire can be one of your starter books that are good
idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that will increase
your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The
copy writer giving his/her effort to put every word into delight arrangement in writing Sexual Fluidity:
Understanding Women's Love and Desire yet doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest
along with based confirm resource information that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great



information can easily drawn you into brand new stage of crucial contemplating.
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