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Making the decision to seek psychotherapy is a challenging one, but for gays, lesbians, bisexuals, or
transgendered persons the challenge is double. Michael Bettinger, a psychotherapist practicing in San
Francisco, lays out a comprehensive guide to the process. From determining if psychotherapy is for you and
overcoming fear of "treatment" to selecting a therapist who is capable of dealing with the unique needs of a
GLBT patient, from scheduling issues to problems with insurance companies, The Lavender Couch is the
one and only book of its kind and the ultimate guide for GLBT patients to choosing the right path to total
mental health.

Michael Bettinger is a psychotherapist, educator, and writer. He is in private practice in San Francisco and
works primarily with people who are gay, lesbian, bisexual, or transgendered.
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From reader reviews:

John Ashton:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
will probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know what kind you should start with. This It's Your Hour:
Guide to Queer-Affirmative Psychotherapy is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world.
Why, because book serves what you want and wish in this era.

William Grimm:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or all their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic in the park.
They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill your
own personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill your free of charge
time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to
try out look for book, may be the reserve untitled It's Your Hour: Guide to Queer-Affirmative Psychotherapy
can be good book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Lisa Mercado:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this publication. This It's Your Hour: Guide to Queer-
Affirmative Psychotherapy is simple to bring you can read it in the area, in the beach, train and also soon. If
you did not have got much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make
you better to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when one buys this book.

Tonette Land:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This It's Your Hour: Guide to Queer-
Affirmative Psychotherapy can be the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are therefore
out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity.
So what these textbooks have than the others?
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