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Designed to help students learn how to assess clients, conduct treatment planning, and evaluate client
outcomes, Counseling Assessment and Evaluation addresses specific CACREP competencies.
Incorporating case studies and examples, authors Joshua C. Watson and Brandé Flamez provide foundational
knowledge for sound formal and informal assessments, cover ethical and legal considerations in assessment,
describe basic statistical concepts, highlight the domains in which assessments are commonly used
(intelligence, aptitude, achievement, personality, career, etc.), and provide strategies for integrating
assessment data when working with clients.

 

“Watson and Flamez have captured the essence of the assessment process in their new book. Through rich
case illustrations and the authors’ deep knowledge of the subject, readers are provided the most current
trends and reflections on the assessment process.”        

        —Bill McHenry, Texas A&M University–Texarkana

 

“The text is very straightforward and easy to read. It encourages students to apply what they are learning
through case illustrations and guided practice exercises.”

                      —Wendy Killam, Stephen F. Austin State University

 

“Watson and Flamez provide the reader with an engaging discussion of the fundamentals of counseling
assessment and evaluation.

                                                                                                     ?—Mark W. Dewalt, Winthrop University

 

“The case illustrations and the practice exercises are exceptional and go a long way toward making the
material accessible. Case examples in the body of the text are also well done.”       

     —Patricia Andersen, Midwestern State University
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From reader reviews:

Katherine Anderson:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can easily
share their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire all their reader with
their story as well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about
the ability about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
kids, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their skill in
writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their book. One of them is this Counseling
Assessment and Evaluation: Fundamentals of Applied Practice (Counseling and Professional Identity).

Doyle Swoope:

Exactly why? Because this Counseling Assessment and Evaluation: Fundamentals of Applied Practice
(Counseling and Professional Identity) is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to
snap it but latter it will shock you with the secret that inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author
who also write the book in such wonderful way makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining
technique but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this nowadays
or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book have such as help
improving your proficiency and your critical thinking way. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I
ended up you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Grace Harrell:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book particularly book
entitled Counseling Assessment and Evaluation: Fundamentals of Applied Practice (Counseling and
Professional Identity) your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every aspect
that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a publication
then become one application form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get before. The
Counseling Assessment and Evaluation: Fundamentals of Applied Practice (Counseling and Professional
Identity) giving you yet another experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful facts
for your better life with this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind will
be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this
extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Lawrence Wilson:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This Counseling Assessment and
Evaluation: Fundamentals of Applied Practice (Counseling and Professional Identity) is simple bringing you
can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not possess much space to



bring often the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can
save the actual book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one
buys this book.
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